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Thematic sessionsConference

The aim of the conference is to uncover links 
between science and technology in the areas 
of energy, fuels and environment, as well as 
to become a venue, to create and develop 
relationships between different academic and 
technical institutions as well as wider industry. 
The sessions will be devoted to discussing the 
difficulties facing the sector, in particular how 
they are perceived in the economies and 
societies. Special attention will be paid to the 
climate change impact on the coal dependent 
economies. 

VENUE
Krakow is the historical capital of Poland and 
the country's major touristic attraction. 
Museums, historical monuments, theatres and 
concert halls give wide possibilities to spend 
time in the city.
AGH University of Science and Technology is 
one of the top technical universities in Poland 
and renown in the international scientific 
communities. Faculty of Energy and Fuels is a 
relatively young but fast growing unit with 
wide international co-operation.

The sessions will discuss aspects of:

     FUELS - new technologies and fuels in  
     carbon constraint economies,
     ENERGY - energy transition, new 
     technologies and innovations in energy, 
     ENVIRONMENT - fuels and energy sectors
     impact on environment especially 
     in relation to climate policies and new
     trends in environmental research.
     ECONOMICS - economic efficiency 
     of technologies as well as costs and 
     prices of energy with relation to carbon
     dioxide emissions abatement policies
     HEALTH - sectors influence on human
     health,
     SOCIETY - sectors perception in societies
     and acceptance of new technologies and 
     climate policy;
     POLICY - trends in energy and
     environmental policies and climate policy. 

http://ef-conference.agh.edu.pl/


	Strona 1
	Strona 2

